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Red Wine 

 
PEIRANO ESTATECABERNET SAUVIGNON 2014  Lodi , California $36/8 

Bright medium ruby. Superripe aromas of blackberry, cassis, mocha, coffee and molten bitter 
chocolate, complemented by nutty oak tones. Plush, dense and fine-grained, offer outstanding 
concentration and lightly saline character to the flavors of dark berries, mocha and coffee. The 
finish is elegant. 

PEIRANO ESTATE SIX CLONESMERLOT 2014 Lodi, California $36/8 

The Six Clones is a seamless effort that remarkably demonstrates it's Right Bank counterparts . 
Sweet black cherry, white chocolate, smoke, and cocoa aromas jump from the glass of this dark 
purple-colored wine. Supple tannins, a velvety mouthfeel, and a lush, heady finish exhibiting 
serious concentration . 

ZORZAL TERRIOR UNICO MALBEC  2014 Tupungato, Argentina  $38/9              

From the highest part of the department of Tupungato in the Valle de Uco.  It's very perfumed 
and spicy, aromatic in a way that makes you go to the glass over and over again. The palate 
has electricity and the Gualtallary chalkiness making for supple notes of raspberries, red 
currants, saline flavors and a very long finish.  

PRIMARY WINES PINOT NOIR 2015 Sonoma, California   $44/10 

Deaply saturated modern Pinot. This sexy Pinot Noir nose offers cherry, earth, spices and 
pepper plus a faint meaty nuance. Supple, spicy and concentrated, but without any undue 
weight. Simply wonderful.  

MONTEFRESCO MONTEPULCIANO 2014 Abruzzo, Italy $32/8 

Fantastic. Inky ruby. Burnished aromas and flavors of dark plum, blackberry jam, coffee, cocoa, 
flint and dried flowers.  Stunning voluptuous texture on the palate with great breadth. Balanced 
acidity gives this long, rich, suptle wine an elegant  character and wonderful definition. Just 
beautiful!  

 

White Wine 

MONTEFRESCO  PINOT GRIGIO 2015 Veneto, Italy $32/8 

A wine of acdity and depth, the 2015 delivers far and beyond your standard Pinot Grigio.  
Impresses for its distinctly stony, mineral-driven personality and overall sense of structure. 
White stone fruits, slate, crushed rocks and flowers meld into the tense finish. It boasts more 
complexity that you might expect.  Thanks to the finisha caressing mouthfeel and tangy finish 
leaves the palate. 
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MASSEY DACTA SAUVIGNON BLANC 2015 Marlborough, New Zealand  $34/9 

Massey Dacta exudes lovely tropical notes to accent a core of fresh grapefruit, baker’s yeast 
and elderflower plus nuances of crushed stones and dill seed. Medium-bodied with wonderful 
concentration and flavor layers that provide punchy citrus fruits and yeastiness, it finishes long. 

 

PRIMARY CHARDONNAY 2014 Lodi, California $36/10 

Pale yellow. Finely-etched citrus and orchard fruit scents, with a chalky accent adding vibrancy. 
Taut and sharply focused, conveying good thrust to its Meyer lemon, orange blossom, pear 
flavors and hazelnuts. Shows a richer fig quality on the penetrating, very long finish. 

 

ANTHONY NAPPA LUMINOUS RIESLING 2015 Finger Lakes, New York $40/10 

Full of fruit in its youth, this shows plenty of concentration. Rather tropical, it seems packed with 
pear and peach, the sugar coming through and very much changing the flavor profile of this 
wine. It is quite delicious showing balance, with some grip on the finish and plenty of tasty fruit 
on the back palate.  

 

Rose Wine 

SAINT ROCH TOURAINE ROSE de LOIRE 2015 Loire Vallley, France $36/9 

Distinctively delicious and intriguingly complex wine. Scents of hibiscus, red raspberry and 
lemon oil inform a high-toned, acidic nose. Gripping zest, crushed cherries, strawberries and 
invigoratingly on the palate, it develops aromatic aromas, finishing with outrageous bracing 
intensity. 

 

Sparkling Wine 

MONTEFRESCO PROSECCO GLERA DOC NV   Veneto, Italy $36/10 

Montefresco exudes pure energy and vibrancy in its white peaches, jasmine, fresh baked bread 
and crushed rocks. The Brut is an intense, sinewy Prosecco that impresses for its balance, 
focus and mineral-drenched finish. 


